
The Establishment of the United Arab
Emirates: A Journey through History (1950-85)
The creation of the United Arab Emirates (UAE) in 1971 marked significant
milestones in the region's history. This federation of seven emirates was not a
sudden development, but the result of years of strategic planning, negotiations,
and collaborations. The period between 1950 and 1985 witnessed profound
transformations in the Arabian Peninsula, leading to the formation of a united
nation that has since become a global economic powerhouse. In this article, we
delve into the intricacies of the establishment of the United Arab Emirates,
exploring the political, social, and economic factors that shaped its history.

Political Dynamics: From Trucial States to a Federation

Prior to the formation of the UAE, the region was known as the Trucial States,
consisting of small sheikhdoms along the southern Persian Gulf coast. These
states, including Abu Dhabi, Dubai, and Sharjah, were under British protection
since the early 19th century. A British political agent oversaw their affairs to
ensure stability and protect British interests in the region.

As the mid-20th century approached, the political landscape began to shift. The
discovery of oil reserves in the Trucial States in the 1950s prompted increased
attention and investments from international powers. The newfound wealth
provided an impetus for the sheikhdoms to explore a more collaborative approach
to governance and development.
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In 1968, the British government announced its intention to withdraw from the
region by 1971, leaving the Trucial States to determine their own future. This
served as a catalyst for the formation of the UAE. The sheikhdoms recognized
the need for unity in the face of potential threats and the desire to leverage their
collective resources for sustainable development.

The Road to Unity: Negotiations and Compromises

Forming a federation required extensive negotiations among the sheikhdoms to
define the terms of their union. This process involved reconciling differing
perspectives, harmonizing legal systems, and determining power-sharing
mechanisms. The late Sheikh Zayed bin Sultan Al Nahyan, the founding father of
the UAE and ruler of Abu Dhabi, played a crucial role in these negotiations,
fostering a spirit of cooperation among the emirates.

During this period, Sheikh Zayed's vision of a unified UAE as a prosperous and
self-reliant nation took shape. He recognized that collaboration among the
emirates was necessary to overcome challenges such as limited resources, tribal
rivalries, and regional instabilities. Together with Sheikh Rashid bin Saeed Al
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Maktoum, the ruler of Dubai, he navigated complex dynamics to pave the way for
a united country.

The negotiations culminated with the signing of the UAE Constitution on
December 2, 1971. Under this constitution, the UAE became a federation with a
provisional government and a clear division of powers between the federal
government and the individual emirates.

Social and Economic Transformations

The establishment of the UAE ushered in a period of rapid social and economic
developments. The newfound unity allowed for greater collaboration in various
sectors, leading to advancements in education, healthcare, infrastructure, and
commerce.

The discovery and exploitation of oil resources provided the necessary financial
fuel to drive economic growth. The leadership of the UAE recognized the need to
diversify their economy beyond oil, paving the way for investments in industries
such as finance, real estate, tourism, and renewable energy. This diversification
strategy has proven crucial in ensuring long-term stability and sustainability.

The UAE's commitment to education has also played a pivotal role in shaping its
growth. Investment in schools, colleges, and universities has facilitated the
development of a skilled workforce, attracting international talent and knowledge
transfer. The nation's dedication to innovation and technological advancements
has positioned it as a global hub for research and development.

Position on the International Stage

Since its establishment, the United Arab Emirates has emerged as a respected
player in the international arena. The nation prioritizes diplomacy, maintaining



strong partnerships with countries across the globe. The UAE plays an active role
in regional and international organizations, contributing to peacekeeping efforts,
humanitarian initiatives, and sustainable development goals.

Additionally, the UAE has become a popular destination for tourism, attracting
visitors with its iconic landmarks, luxurious resorts, and cultural heritage. Its
modern infrastructure, including state-of-the-art airports and advanced
transportation networks, has made it a global aviation and logistics hub.

The Legacy of the United Arab Emirates

The establishment of the United Arab Emirates is a testament to the power of
collaboration, strategic vision, and determination. From humble beginnings as
individual sheikhdoms, the UAE has transformed into a thriving nation that
continues to set ambitious goals and pursue excellence.

The UAE's journey from 1950 to 1985 showcases the unparalleled development
and growth achieved through unity and forward-thinking leadership. The nation
stands as a model for other countries seeking to forge their own paths towards
stability, prosperity, and global recognition.

The establishment of the United Arab Emirates in 1971 marked a turning point in
the region's history. The federation brought together seven emirates, laying the
foundation for a united, prosperous, and globally influential nation. The UAE's
commitment to collaboration, innovation, and sustainable development has
allowed it to successfully navigate the complexities of a rapidly evolving world. As
the country celebrates its achievements, it also looks towards the future with
aspirations of continued growth, diversification, and global leadership.

The Establishment of the United Arab Emirates
1950-85 (Routledge Library Editions: History of the

https://best-book-downloads.web.app/free-book.html?pdf-file=eyJjdCI6Im5xQThZelwvdEpXMTBzNUw2OUd4VytnNDVVZnBvMm9wQ1BoQ3lzR1d1UjA2REJlRDVBZmtpcDdqT3UxcWhPN1hDclwvaHBlR1BjNmlDYkpyeHd5YlZDYzRPekV5Tk55SFpxU1RpcjZ2RDl4QnN0RGh1MVlPTWkrcFFqeFVCNU5ScGZMVnZmQ0ppcVwvY3BrMmI5MnpTcjFOUXVwVmtDeGRZTkxDc1RUSUpqOFFTdnN6N0g2WVJwQ1BsWnVBS2d3eFFRWnE3TW9mVE1rSWh3OFwvR3NBRmdockJ3S3AxOWNOWGJZZm03eUh3aCtGRHpuQTNmTlNmRnFvdzNnOEJPN2dXT1QxWmR5MGNYWU9QQ1NRZVdcL21pbzkwVUE9PSIsIml2IjoiOTU2YTI5ZWVmNGFjNjNmNGZjZDRhN2RiZDViOGJhNjEiLCJzIjoiYjA5ZTgyYTBmMTNmZGUwMyJ9


Middle East Book 4)
by Abdullah Omran Taryam(1st Edition, Kindle Edition)

5 out of 5
Language : English
File size : 2497 KB
Text-to-Speech : Enabled
Screen Reader : Supported
Enhanced typesetting : Enabled
Word Wise : Enabled
Print length : 302 pages

The United Arab Emirates were established in response to the British decision to
withdraw from the Gulf by 1971. This decision, announced in 1968, had left the
rulers of the emirates perplexed and alarmed. After decades of mutual suspicion
and rivalry, fostered by British imperial dominance, the emirates were now
obliged to seek security in fede
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