
Rugby Practice Or Playdate Ideas For
Children
Rugby is a popular sport that can help children develop essential skills and
values such as teamwork, discipline, and sportsmanship. Whether you are
looking for ideas to organize a rugby practice session or planning a rugby
playdate for your children, this article will provide you with engaging and fun
activities to ensure their participation and enjoyment.

Rugby Practice Ideas

1. Mini-Game Tournaments

Divide the children into teams and organize mini-game tournaments. This will
enable them to practice their rugby skills, such as passing, running with the ball,
and tackling, in a competitive and enjoyable setting. You can set up different
stations, each focusing on specific skills, and rotate the teams to ensure equal
participation.
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2. Agility and Coordination Drills

Conduct agility and coordination drills to improve your children's overall physical
abilities. Set up obstacle courses that require them to jump over hurdles, zigzag
through cones, and perform quick direction changes. These drills will enhance
their balance, speed, and spatial awareness on the rugby field.

3. Scrimmages and Mock Matches

Organize scrimmages and mock matches to help children apply their rugby skills
in a game-like scenario. Divide them into teams and let them play short matches,
encouraging them to utilize their passing, communication, and decision-making
abilities. By simulating real game situations, children will gain experience and
confidence on the field.

Rugby Playdate Ideas

1. Rugby Treasure Hunt

Create a rugby-themed treasure hunt by hiding rugby-related items or clues
around your backyard or local park. Provide the children with maps or riddles
leading to the hidden treasures. This activity will not only get them engaged in
Rugby but also enhance their problem-solving and teamwork skills.

2. Rugby Mini-Olympics

Plan a mini-Olympics event with various rugby-inspired challenges. The
challenges may include relay races, passing accuracy competitions, and kicking
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contests. Assign points to each completed challenge and award medals at the
end. This will encourage friendly competition and improve the children's overall
rugby skills.

3. Rugby Tag

Play a game of rugby tag, a modified version of tag where players have to tag
opponents by touching them with a rugby ball. This game will improve the
children's agility, evasion, and ball-handling abilities. Set boundaries and
establish rules to ensure fair play and safety during the game.

Rugby practice or playdates for children can be exciting and educational. By
incorporating these engaging ideas, your children will not only enjoy their time but
also develop essential skills and values that rugby promotes. Remember to
prioritize safety and ensure fair play throughout all activities. So, gather your
children and their friends, and let the rugby adventures begin!
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My First Rugby Drills

Use rugby as the vehicle for your child to have FUN whilst safely developing
coordination, communication, confidence, decision making, respect, discipline,
and team working skills!

Run a rugby practice with your child, using these drills, or invite their friends for a
rugby playdate!

The drills are inclusive; suitable regardless of physical ability and gender.

The book contains all the instruction you need, plus notes to run the activities
safely and include tips for extending the scope of the activities as the children
develop.

Suitable for children aged 3 and above.
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